NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services

Office of City Prourement

EPIN: 85724B0087
Bid Title: HVAC Air Filters
Bid Opening Date: 5/21/2024
Procurement Analyst Fenglin Guo

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY — SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION

Class 1:
Vendors Response Price
GREEN EARTH DUCT CLEANING S 991,826.49
FILTERBUY, INC. S 1,002,287.71
AIR ENGINEERING FILTERS INC S 1,035,301.25
FASTENAL COMPANY S 1,044,546.04
BROOKAIRE COMPANY, LLC S 1,113,547.40
CRIBPROCURE INC. S 1,167,444.54
UNITED SUPPLY CORP S 1,606,404.52
FINESSE CREATIONS INC S 1,651,949.80
FLORENCE FILTER CORPORATION S 1,769,550.44
ARMH SOLUTIONS LLC S 4,314,456.00
Class 2:
Vendors Response Price
AIR ENGINEERING FILTERS INC S 1,544,204.60
FINESSE CREATIONS INC S 1,560,779.64
FILTERBUY, INC. S 1,640,257.26
CRIBPROCURE INC. S 1,965,092.33
FASTENAL COMPANY $ 2,085,156.73
BROOKAIRE COMPANY, LLC S 2,122,492.62
UNITED SUPPLY CORP $ 2,219,036.94
GREEN EARTH DUCT CLEANING S 2,396,089.13
FLORENCE FILTER CORPORATION S 3,872,734.60
ARMH SOLUTIONS LLC S 9,246,105.00
Class 3:
Vendors Response Price
BROOKAIRE COMPANY, LLC S 232,106.20
AIR ENGINEERING FILTERS INC S 241,355.00
FASTENAL COMPANY S 356,651.40
FLORENCE FILTER CORPORATION S 478,681.20
CRIBPROCURE INC. S 757,731.10
FILTERBUY, INC. S 823,765.90
FINESSE CREATIONS INC NO BID
GREEN EARTH DUCT CLEANING NO BID
UNITED SUPPLY CORP NO BID
ARMH SOLUTIONS LLC NO BID




NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services

Office of City Prourement

EPIN: 85724B0087
Bid Title: HVAC Air Filters
Bid Opening Date: 5/21/2024
Procurement Analyst Fenglin Guo

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY — SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION

Class 4:

Vendors Response Price
AIR ENGINEERING FILTERS INC S 243,712.50
BROOKAIRE COMPANY, LLC S 275,390.60
FASTENAL COMPANY S 414,602.80
CRIBPROCURE INC. S 624,396.00
FLORENCE FILTER CORPORATION S 629,088.60
FILTERBUY, INC. S 1,010,096.00
FINESSE CREATIONS INC NO BID
GREEN EARTH DUCT CLEANING NO BID
UNITED SUPPLY CORP NOBID
ARMH SOLUTIONS LLC NOBID

Class 5:

Vendors Response Price
BROOKAIRE COMPANY, LLC $ 242,234.00
AIR ENGINEERING FILTERS INC $ 256,000.00
FASTENAL COMPANY $ 374,263.00
FLORENCE FILTER CORPORATION $ 554,130.50
CRIBPROCURE INC. $ 577,396.40
FILTERBUY, INC. $ 850,912.70
FINESSE CREATIONS INC NO BID
GREEN EARTH DUCT CLEANING NO BID
UNITED SUPPLY CORP NO BID

ARMH SOLUTIONS LLC

NO BID




	CLASS - Items 85724B0087-Ranked

