
NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services
Office of Citywide Procurement
EPIN: 85722B0093, Hot Asphalt Paving Mix Del Into City Trucks
Opening Date: January 6, 2022 FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY - SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION
Procurement Analyst: Alvin Pettway

Class City Asphalt LLC RCA Asphalt LLC Peckham Materials Corp Green Asphalt Co LLC Tully Construction Co Inc Jocar Asphalt LLC
1 No Bid $41,913,655.90 $44,795,241.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $61,429,613.40 $55,063,048.08 $63,240,588.00
3 $36,779,059.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 No Bid $41,913,655.90 $44,795,241.63 $36,551,684.61 No Bid No Bid
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Charge $55,063,048.08 $63,240,588.00
6 $36,779,059.05 No Bid No Bid No Charge No Bid No Bid

Total $73,558,118.10 $83,827,311.80 $89,590,483.26 $97,981,298.01 $110,126,096.16 $126,481,176.00


	Sheet1

