NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services

Office of Citywide Procurement

EPIN: 85722B0081, Kitchen Appliances

Opening Date: December 2, 2021

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY - SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION

Procurement Analyst: Ebony Roberson

Class Chefs Depot Inc Klearview Appliance Corp Salsa Professional Apparel LLC Finesse Creations Inc 1 Stop Electronics Center Inc
1 $2,218,007.25 No Bid $2,981,925.00 $2,352,500.00 $3,088,275.00
2 $462,278.00 No Bid $485,500.00 $424,000.00 $351,300.00
3 No Bid $634,125.00 No Bid $663,500.00 $543,075.00
4 No Bid $1,862,500.00 No Bid $2,304,000.00 $1,783,500.00
5 No Bid $482,500.00 No Bid $443,750.00 $428,750.00
Total $2,680,885.25 $2,979,125.00 $3,467,425.00 $6,187,750.00 $6,194,900.00
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