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Class Toshiba Business Solutions Konica Minolta Business Solutions USA Inc Xerox Corporation Canon Solutions America Inc Mega Business Systems
1 $19,040.00 $31,553.00 $28,280.00 $60,356.20 $280,800.00
2 $152,200.00 $158,105.00 $211,650.00 $152,184.00 $545,625.00
3 $170,000.00 $119,972.50 $104,550.00 No Bid $616,450.00
4 $260,850.00 $226,900.00 $244,750.00 $281,093.50 $674,625.00
5 $278,500.00 $327,120.00 $277,600.00 $360,785.50 $702,625.00
6 $130,420.00 $181,681.20 $222,814.20 $157,717.00 $376,062.00
7 $139,900.00 $246,596.00 $222,814.20 $213,731.00 $402,875.00
8 $437,840.00 $246,596.00 $222,814.20 $265,532.60 $489,750.00
9 $437,840.00 $303,344.00 $222,814.20 $309,334.20 $489,750.00

10 No Bid $785,880.00 $281,238.00 $787,970.60 $665,534.40
11 No Bid $393,440.00 $157,633.60 $468,700.00 $332,767.20
12 $49,400.00 $34,101.00 $33,320.00 No Bid $439,512.00
13 $246,900.00 $382,332.50 $217,600.00 No Bid $1,647,512.50
14 $282,100.00 $506,790.00 $223,550.00 $299,744.50 $1,512,120.00
15 $306,850.00 $531,875.00 $255,950.00 $351,140.50 $1,497,600.00
16 $282,070.00 $355,150.00 $153,700.00 $241,811.90 $898,560.00
17 $345,430.00 $437,287.00 No Bid $913,816.10 $1,041,192.00
18 $368,050.00 $497,959.00 No Bid $2,987,762.30 $1,051,200.00
19 $27,500.00 $38,828.00 $116,575.00 $67,006.00 $414,000.00
20 $278,200.00 $277,996.00 $585,460.00 $206,192.00 $887,220.00
21 $320,900.00 $188,948.00 $475,800.00 No Bid $979,020.00
22 $977,000.00 $782,840.00 $1,383,008.00 $745,588.00 $2,301,840.00
23 $1,034,600.00 $1,136,576.00 $1,824,296.00 $953,236.00 $2,287,440.00
24 $879,800.00 $1,136,594.00 $2,295,734.00 $767,656.00 $2,212,488.00
25 $1,241,200.00 $2,074,360.00 $3,064,312.00 $1,382,888.00 $3,221,640.00
26 $1,916,600.00 $1,037,180.00 $1,532,156.00 $855,316.00 $1,947,780.00
27 $1,916,600.00 $1,261,712.00 $1,532,156.00 $998,704.00 $1,947,780.00
28 No Bid $3,239,536.00 $2,187,952.00 $3,285,080.00 $3,300.000.00
29 No Bid $2,026,210.00 $1,743,940.00 $2,488,640.00 $3,300,000.00
30 No Bid No Bid $1,211,583.00 $1,019,991.00 $1,529,550.00
31 $67,460.00 $37,200.80 $104,612.00 No Bid $465,804.00
32 $220,300.00 $299,494.00 $296,458.00 No Bid $1,146,496.50
33 $239,900.00 $380,810.00 $381,038.00 $196,534.00 $1,097,460.00
34 $267,800.00 $406,910.00 $421,628.00 $233,380.00 $1,053,558.00
35 $850,000.00 $890,624.00 $846,068.00 $522,892.00 $2,107,116.00
36 $1,008,400.00 $1,209,904.00 $2,159,056.00 $2,508,392.00 $3,760,800.00
37 $407,800.00 $518,854.00 $1,086,100.00 $3,032,570.00 $1,970,100.00
38 No Bid $946,180.00 $956,122.00 $1,104,854.00 $793,518.00
39 No Bid $559,390.00 $872,200.00 $1,191,230.00 $1,156,266.00

Total $15,561,450.00 $24,216,829.00 $28,157,332.40 $29,411,828.90 $51,544,436.60
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