NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services

Office of Citywide Procurement

EPIN: 85721B0127
Title: Scuba Equipment & Supply (Brand Spec., & Non-Brand Spec.) - NYPD

Bid Opening Date: May 4, 2021
Procurement Analyst: Brian Lee

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY - SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION

LEISURE PRO ALL HANDS FIRE EQUIPMENT  [HOUSE OF SCUBA GLOBAL EMPIRE
Class Award 1 NO BID 10,959.90 NO BID 13,463.40
Class Award 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID 14,891.25
Class Award 3 NO BID 33,976.80 NO BID 49,313.55
Class Award 4 8,025.00 7,799.40 7,600.84 10,173.07
Class Award 5 1,349.70 NO BID 1,230.45 2,649.07
Class Award 6 9,243.70 666.40 43,295.80 46,389.34
Total 18,618.40 53,402.50 52,127.09 136,879.68




