
EPIN: FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY – SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION
Bid Title:
Bid Opening 
Date:

Item Code Item Description
MIVILA CORP. 
MIVILA FOODS

FINESSE 
CREATIONS INC

TERI NICHOLS 
INSTITUTIONAL FOOD 
MERCHANTS LLC

UNIVERSAL COFFEE 
CORPORATION

UNIVERSAL ATLANTIC 
INC

Salsa Professional 
Apparel LLC

GLOBAL FOOD 
INDUSTRIES LLC

i1_1 BAY LEAVES $2,436.00 $18,648.00 NO BID $1,753.92 NO BID $4,410.00 NO BID
i1_2 CHILI POWDER $20,880.00 $97,200.00 $20,793.60 $14,205.60 $2,707.20 $46,224.00 NO BID
i1_3 CINNAMON, GROUND $5,456.00 $27,984.00 $5,610.88 $3,850.88 NO BID $8,430.40 NO BID
i1_4 GARLIC POWDER $99,944.00 $522,288.00 $58,709.04 $71,508.32 NO BID $338,520.00 NO BID
i1_5 SAGE, POWDER OR GROUND $862.50 $5,160.00 NO BID $588.00 NO BID $363.00 NO BID
i1_6 NUTMEG, GROUND $1,300.00 $6,160.00 NO BID $1,129.60 NO BID $2,955.00 NO BID
i1_7 OREGANO, LEAF $20,596.50 $165,600.00 $19,927.20 $11,233.20 NO BID $48,645.00 NO BID
i1_8 PAPRIKA, GROUND $23,220.00 $91,160.00 $20,536.80 $15,892.80 NO BID $68,800.00 NO BID
i1_9 GARLIC, CHOPPED $5,342.40 $25,760.00 $4,677.12 $3,299.52 NO BID $9,968.00 NO BID
i1_10 PEPPER, BLACK, GROUND $38,640.50 $156,960.00 $35,839.20 $31,479.20 $5,384.60 $111,997.50 NO BID
i1_11 CURRY POWDER $32,915.20 $142,080.00 $63,793.92 $23,537.92 $3,895.36 $71,632.00 NO BID
i1_12 THYME, POWDERED $7,198.00 $38,064.00 NO BID $5,826.72 NO BID $26,291.00 NO BID
i1_13 PICKLE, RELISH, SWEET $61,601.00 $180,230.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $96,167.50 $60,578.80
i1_14 VINEGAR, CIDER $28,294.80 $54,264.00 $48,785.92 NO BID NO BID $76,874.00 NO BID

i1_15
SOUP BASE, VEGETABLE, LOW 
SODIUM $65,670.00 $202,400.00 $72,336.00 $40,656.00 $87,978.00 $187,000.00 NO BID

i1_16
SEASONING, JERK, DRIED, LOW 
SODIUM $32,901.00 $121,440.00 $58,080.00 $16,981.80 NO BID $70,290.00 NO BID

i1_17
TACO SEASONING, LOW 
SODIUM $26,640.00 $73,260.00 NO BID $17,715.60 NO BID $26,640.00 NO BID

i1_18
WORCESTERSHIRE SAUCE, LOW 
SODIUM $15,205.50 $64,310.00 NO BID $9,646.50 NO BID $34,062.50 NO BID

i1_19
BROWNING & SEASONING 
SAUCE $42,904.00 $359,840.00 NO BID $44,813.92 NO BID $206,216.00 NO BID

i1_20 SOY SAUCE, LOW SODIUM $14,006.50 $104,640.00 NO BID $9,025.20 NO BID $32,155.00 NO BID

i1_21
YELLOW/EGG SHADE FOOD 
COLORING $4,934.40 $68,352.00 NO BID $4,312.32 NO BID $7,872.00 NO BID

i1_22 SALAD DRESSING, LOW SODIUM $179,100.00 $828,000.00 $162,840.00 NO BID NO BID $279,000.00 NO BID

i1_23 TOMATO CATSUP $4,222.80 $23,000.00 $4,577.92 NO BID NO BID $7,820.00 NO BID
i1_24 CAJUN SEASONING $1,671.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $1,432.80 NO BID $3,255.00 NO BID
i1_25 MAYONNAISE, LOW SODIUM $6,228.40 $14,536.00 $5,313.92 NO BID NO BID $8,694.00 NO BID

i1_26
MUSTARD, PREPARED GERMAN 
STYLE $1,336.50 $6,750.00 $1,799.10 NO BID NO BID $1,575.00 NO BID

i1_27 PARSLEY, FLAKES $7,268.00 $194,304.00 NO BID $6,670.00 NO BID $14,214.00 NO BID

i1_28
SOUP BASE, CHICKEN FLAVOR, 
LOW SODIUM $2,695.50 NO BID $3,499.20 $1,843.20 NO BID $3,780.00 NO BID

i1_29 ALL SPICE POWDER $4,270.50 $16,200.00 NO BID $4,219.20 NO BID $15,750.00 NO BID
i1_30 BASIL $5,492.40 $62,744.00 NO BID $3,864.00 NO BID $50,600.00 NO BID
i1_31 BBQ SAUCE, LOW SODIUM $4,176.80 $23,552.00 NO BID $4,090.32 NO BID $9,016.00 NO BID
i1_32 CORIANDER POWDER $1,462.80 $4,968.00 NO BID $1,135.28 NO BID $5,796.00 NO BID
i1_33 CUMIN $2,970.00 $11,880.00 NO BID $2,419.20 NO BID $6,435.00 NO BID
i1_34 FRENCH DRESSING $7,540.00 $25,480.00 $8,548.80 NO BID NO BID $19,760.00 NO BID
i1_35 GINGER, GROUND $3,321.00 $12,960.00 NO BID $2,599.20 NO BID $7,380.00 NO BID
i1_36 HONEY $9,108.00 $33,120.00 $12,673.92 NO BID NO BID $7,314.00 NO BID
i1_37 OLD BAY SEASONING $1,782.00 $7,776.00 NO BID $1,754.28 NO BID $4,140.00 NO BID
i1_38 ONION, POWDER $1,971.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $1,492.80 NO BID $2,700.00 NO BID
i1_39 RANCH DRESSING $9,334.00 $28,340.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14,495.00 NO BID
i1_40 SALT, KOSHER $2,421.00 $3,150.00 NO BID $1,872.00 NO BID $2,722.50 NO BID

i1_41
SALT, TABLE EVAPORATED, 
IODIZED $985.50 $1,530.00 NO BID $1,255.50 NO BID $1,372.50 NO BID

i1_42
SOUP BASE, BEEF FLAVOR, LOW 
SODIUM $2,151.00 NO BID $3,139.20 $2,203.20 NO BID $4,275.00 NO BID

i1_43 TUMERIC, GROUND $807.00 $2,160.00 NO BID $734.40 NO BID $4,200.00 NO BID
i1_44 VINEGAR, DISTILLED, WHITE $1,444.40 $3,312.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,208.00 NO BID
i1_45 TOMATO KETCHUP $40,176.00 $155,520.00 $32,889.60 NO BID NO BID $66,240.00 NO BID
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