NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services

Office of Citywide Procurement

EPIN: 85721B0049 FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY — SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION
Bid Title: DOC - Baking Products and Baked Goods
Bid Opening 3/9/2021
Date:
Class 1: DOC Vendors
ATLANTIC
JAMAC FROZEN [JAMAC FROZEN (MIVILA CORP. MIVILA |FRESH AND TASTY UNIVERSAL COFFEE  |VALENTE YEAST COUNTRYWIDE BEVERAGE
Item Code Item Description FOOD CORP FOOD CORP FOODS BAKED PRODUCTS... FINESSE CREATIONS INC |CORPORATION COMPANY INC Element 9 LLC [STONE LLC COMPANY LLC
i11 MOLASSES, DARK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22,394.00 $17,776.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BREAD EMULSIFIER, PURE
. uLs /PU NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14,285.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1 2 VEGETABLE TYPE
. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40,500.00 $21,287.70 $18,427.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
il13 MINERAL OIL, WHITE, U.S.P.
il 4 PAN GREASING OIL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5,890.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID
HARD TROUGH GREASE
’ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,189.64 495, NO BID NO BID NO BID
il1.5 WHITE PETROLEUM U.S.P. 0 ° ° ° ° 22,1896 23,495.39 0 ° 0
. DRY MALT, (FLAVOR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4,784.00 $5,044.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
il 6 ENHANCER)
FLOUR, BREAD, WHITE -
BLEACHED, HARD WHEAT, NO BID NO BID $477,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $469,200.00 $264,800.00 $537,600.00
il 7 ENRICHED
FLOUR, WHOLE WHEAT, TYPE
18 " NO BID NO BID $517,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $510,800.00 $260,000.00 $487,400.00
i1.9 YEAST FOOD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,300,000.00 $6,292.00 $6,032.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SUGAR, FINE GRANULATED,
1 10 (TYPE Il NO BID NO BID $61,020.00 NO BID $104,400.00 $51,192.00 $50,580.00 $80,820.00 NO BID NO BID
BID BID BID BID BID BID . BID BID BID
i 11 YEAST, COMPRESSED, CAKES NO BI NO BI NO BI NO BI NO BI NO BI $39,990.00 NO BI NO BI NO BI
i1 12 ROPE & MOLD INHIBITOR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $650,000.00 $7,748.00 $9,932.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1 13 MILK, WHOLE, DRY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $260,000.00 $95,904.00 $93,040.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
il 14 BAKING SODA NO BID NO BID $298.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
il _15 DATES, WHOLE PITTED NO BID NO BID $2,177.50 NO BID NO BID $1,981.20 NO BID $1,804.40
RAISINS, THOMPSON
. ’ ! NO BID NO BID $2,800.00 NO BID $7,500.00 $2,494.00 $2,629.50 $2,083.00 NO BID NO BID
il 16 SEEDLESS
il 17 BAKING POWDER NO BID NO BID $248.50 NO BID $1,600.00 NO BID $743.40 $688.30 NO BID NO BID
WALNUTS, SHELLED, LIGHT
’ ! NO BID NO BID 25. NO BID . . 250. 1 . NO BID NO BID
i1 18 HALVES AND PIECES 0] 0] $5,625.00 0] $8,500.00 $3,900.00 $5,250.00 $13,530.00 0] (0]
i1 19 SALT, TABLE NO BID NO BID $7,665.00 NO BID $41,300.00 $6,951.00 $8,393.00 $29,330.00 NO BID NO BID
il 20 SALAD OIL (CANOLA OIL) NO BID NO BID $124,625.00 NO BID NO BID $98,700.00 NO BID $112,500.00 NO BID NO BID
EGGS, WHOLE, FROZEN WITH
’ ’ $3,240.00 $3,240.00 $3,508.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,690.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CITRIC ACID, HOMOGENIZED
i1 21 & PASTEURIZED
. KOSHER WHOLE WHEAT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
il 22 BREAD
MUFFINS, CORN. SUGAR-
i1 23 FREE $50,180.00 $50,180.00 $56,810.00 $94,770.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,141,920.00 NO BID NO BID
MUFFINS, BRAN, SUGAR-
i1 24 EREE ’ ’ $50,180.00 $50,180.00 $56,810.00 $94,770.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,190,670.00 NO BID NO BID
MUFFINS, BLUEBERRY,
. $50,180.00 $50,180.00 $56,810.00 $94,770.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,218,750.00 NO BID NO BID
il 25 SUGAR-FREE
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