NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services
Office of City Prourement
EPIN: 85721B0048 FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY — SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION
Bid Title: Baby Food
Bid Opening 3/10/2021
Date:
Class 1: DOC Vendors
UNIVERSAL COFFEE
Item Code Item Description MIVILA CORP. MIVILA FOODS |FINESSE CREATIONS INC CORPORATION BABYLAB INC. Element 9 LLC
il 1 INFANT OATMEAL CEREAL $88.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $68.65
i1 2 INFANT RICE CEREAL $88.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $94.40
i1 3 STRAINED APPLESAUCE $54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.55
il 4 STRAINED PEACHES $54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.50
i1 5 STRAINED PEAR $54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.50
16 STRAINED SWEET POTATOES $54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.50
STRAINED BEEF WITH BEEF
. $69.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID $61.90
i17 BROTH
STRAINED CHICKEN WITH
. NO BID NO BID NO BID 7
il 8 CHICKEN BROTH 269.90 © © 0 °58.75
i1 9 STRAINED GREEN BEANS $54.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.50
. $47.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.50
il1_10 STRAINED MIXED VEGETABLES
i1 11 JUICE, APPLE, 100% $97.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.75
HI-PRO PLUS FOOD
SUPPLEMENT, VANILLA NO BID $19,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1 12 FLAVOR
. BID . NO BID 144.
il 13 SENSITIVE POWDER FORMULA >870.00 NO »869.90 0 »144.95
GENTLEASE POWDER
i1 14 EORMULA $595.00 NO BID $596.80 NO BID $149.95
15 PROSOBE POWDER FORMULA $612.50 NO BID $662.00 NO BID $143.70
116 BABY MUM MUM RICE RUSKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $162.45
i1 17 GRADUATES FINGER FOOD $92.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $81.15
il 18 STAGE 2 BABY FOOD $74.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $73.50
i1 _19 STAGE 2 BABY FOOD $74.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $117.20
il 20 STAGE 3 BABY FOOD $114.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.90
i1 21 SUPPORTED SITTER CEREAL $149.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $161.65
NUTRITIONAL POWDER DRINK
i1 22 MIX, LIGHT START NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,664.20
ESSENTIAL HIGH PROTEIN
POWNDER, CLASSIC FRENCH NO BID $3,250.00 NO BID NO BID $2,499.50
i1 23 VANILLA FLAVOR
Class 2: ACS Vendors
UNIVERSAL COFFEE
Item Code Item Description MIVILA CORP. MIVILA FOODS |FINESSE CREATIONS INC CORPORATION BABYLAB INC. Element 9 LLC
2.1 PRO ADVANCE READY TO USE NO BID $18,900.00 $22,869.00 $14,952.00 $27,295.80
NEOSURE 22CAL READY TO
2 2 USE NO BID $24,150.00 $24,780.00 $12,915.00 $14,469.00
- Pro-Sensitive Non-GMO Infant
_ ro->ensitive fon ntan NO BID $8,880.00 $5,274.24 $2,553.60 $3,112.80
i2_3 Formula with Iron
SPECIAL CARE 24 PREMATURE
NO BID $21,000.00 $14,160.00 $11,280.00 $11,848.80
INFANT FORMULA WITH IRON
i2_4 AND OPTIGRO
i2. 5 GENTLEASE READY TO USE NO BID $20,580.00 $14,968.80 $16,065.00 $6,295.80
i2_6 PROSOBEE READY TO USE NO BID $24,990.00 $15,808.80 $16,065.00 $18,879.00
.7 NUTRAMIGEN READY TO USE NO BID $27,090.00 $16,312.80 $17,136.00 11,018.70
i2_ 8 NEUROPRO INFANT NO BID $58,800.00 $45,292.80 $44,744.00 39,144.00
A.R. READY TO FEED INFANT
2.9 EORMULA NO BID $4,212.00 $2,710.08 $2,754.00 $3,149.28
i2_10 NEUROPRO ENFACARE NO BID $4,248.00 $2,710.08 $2,754.00 $2,300.40
PEDIASURE ASSORTED
FLAVORS
6,348.00 10,800.00 4,540.80 5,400.00 5,274.00
VANILLA/CHOCOLATE/STRAW 26, >10, >4 »5, »5,
i2 11 BERRY
ENSURE ASSORTED FLAVORS
2,929. . 2,441. 2 . 215.1
VANILLA/CHOCOLATE/STRAW 22,929.50 »3,850.00 °2, 60 »2,660.00 23,215.10
i2_12 BERRY
i2 13 PEDIALYTE $3,213.00 NO BID $3,071.60 $3,115.00 $2,738.40
SINGLE GRAIN OATMEAL
2 14 BABY CEREAL $4,025.00 $5,180.00 $3,903.20 $4,060.00 $3,955.00
i2_15 INSTANT OATMEAL $1,953.00 $3,360.00 NO BID $2,100.00 $2,581.60
MICROWAVEABLE PASTA
439, 1 . NO BID 7 . 14,910.
2 16 BOWLS VARIETY PACK $5,439.00 $10,080.00 0] $7,560.00 $14,910.00
STAGE 1 FRUIT & VEGETABLE, $2,499.00 $4,200.00 NO BID $2,499.00 $3,609.90
i2_17 ASSORTED VARIETY
STAGE 2 FRUIT & VEGETABLE, $3,129.00 NO BID NO BID $2,310.00 $5,785.50
i2_18 ASSORTED VARIETY
STAGE 3 FRUIT & VEGETABLE, $3,129.00 NO BID NO BID $4,410.00 $5,894.70
i2_ 19 ASSORTED VARIETY
STAGE 1 BABY FOOD-DINNER, $2,835.00 NO BID NO BID $2,940.00 $3,347.40
i2_20 ASSORTED VARIETY
STAGE 2 BABY FOOD DINNER, $3,129.00 NO BID NO BID $3,150.00 $4,179.00
i2_21 ASSORTED VARIETY
STAGE 3 BABY FOOD-DINNER, $4,588.50 NO BID NO BID $4,410.00 $8,276.10
i2_22 ASSORTED VARIETY
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