NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services

Office of Citywide Procurement

EPIN: 85721B0023 FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY - SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION
Bid Title: DOC - Processed Fresh & Frozen Foods (GP)
Bid Opening 3/9/2021
Date:
Class 1: DOC Vendors
TERI NICHOLS
CHEF'S CHOICE CASH & JAMAC FROZEN FOOD |MIVILA CORP. MIVILA |INSTITUTIONAL FOOD CHANNEL FISH LUCINA'S GOURMET MADE FRESH SALADS
Item Code Item Description CARRY FOOD DIST INC GOLDEN PLATTER FOODS INC |CORP. FOODS MERCHANTS LLC T & L CREATIVE SALADS |PROCESSING CO INC CARDINAL FOODS LLC ROMEO FOODS INC ACE-ENDICO CORP Element 9 LLC FOOD INC INC DAGAN PIZZA CORP RAY KAY PRODUCE INC
il11 TURKEY, SLICED NO BID NO BID NO BID $175,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $162,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BEEF SALAMI, BEEF. NYC
SPEC: #14-5-36:09 - SAUSAGE NO BID NO BID NO BID $71,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
il 2 PRODUCTS.
AUSAGE, TURKEY, SMOKED
SAUSAGE, TU , SMO ’ NO BID NO BID $144,000.00 $261,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $231,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
AS PER NYC SPEC: #14-S-
i1 3 36:09 - SAUSAGE.
. NO BID NO BID $58,800.00 NO BID NO BID $82,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $41,150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
il 4 MEATBALLS, TRANSFAT FREE.
MEATLOAF (BEEF), WITH
. ( ) NO BID $147,600.00 $123,902.00 $266,090.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
il15 BROWN GRAVY
VEAL PATTIES, WITH ITALIAN NO BID $192,000.00 $276,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $415,140.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
il 6 FLAVORED BREADING
BEEF PATTIES, JAMAICAN
. $245,000.00 NO BID $322,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $414,960.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1 7 STYLE, TRANS FAT FREE.
BEEF AND SOY BURGER NO BID NO BID $156,300.00 $94,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $94,770.00 NO BID NO BID $194,580.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
il 8 PATTIES, 65% LEAN BEEF, IQF
TURKEY PATTIES CAJUN
STYLE, BREADED, FULLY NO BID $75,480.00 $124,270.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1 9 COOKED
CHICKEN PATTIES, FULLY
’ NO BID $126,000.00 $137,160.00 $438,750.00 $413,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $319,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COOKED, BREADED, SQUARE
i1 10 OR RECTANGULAR SHAPED.
IMPS #800 FRANKFURTERS,
. NO BID NO BID $183,000.00 $179,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,400,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1 11 BEEF, FORMULA D, STYLE C
i1 12 SALAD, EGG NO BID NO BID NO BID $38,160.00 $116,640.00 $112,800.00 NO BID NO BID $115,200.00 $115,808.00 $97,600.00 NO BID $124,800.00 $141,600.00 NO BID
i1 13 SALAD, TUNA NO BID NO BID NO BID $41,360.00 $158,400.00 $156,000.00 NO BID NO BID $137,600.00 $136,608.00 $107,200.00 NO BID $158,400.00 $189,600.00 NO BID
i1 14 VEGGIE BURGER NO BID $384,000.00 $422,400.00 $1,171,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $449,600.00 NO BID $780,800.00 $13,368,000.00 $288,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
IMPS #800 FRANKFURTERS,
TURKEY, FORMULA D, STYLE NO BID NO BID $98,500.00 $87,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $84,000.00 $1,351,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1_15 C
P1ZZA POCKET, ITALIAN STYLE NO BID NO BID $595,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $299,760.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1 16 STUFFED SANDWICH.
FISH, FROZEN, WHITING
. ’ ’ NO BID NO BID $717,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $521,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $829,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1_17 (ATLANTIC OR PACIFIC)
SALMON CAKES, FROZEN
. ! ’ NO BID NO BID $148,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $100,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $512,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
il 18 PRE-COOKED BREADED
CHICKEN PATTIES, JAMAICAN $276,500.00 NO BID $322,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $247,660.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1 19 STYLE, TRANS FAT FREE.
VEGETABLE PATTY,
JAMAICAN STYLE, TRANS FAT $256,750.00 NO BID $299,650.00 NO BID $259,935.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $195,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1 20 FREE.
. BEAN AND CHEESE NO BID NO BID $47,840.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i1 21 BURRITO,TRANS FAT FREE.
CORN, FROZEN WHOLE
i1 29 KERNI;L NO BID NO BID $35,520.00 $31,920.00 $32,256.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $59,928.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $34,020.00
i1 .
il 23 COLLARD GREENS NO BID NO BID $27,024.00 $51,408.00 $34,656.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $62,136.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $36,504.00
CAULIFLOWER, BQF ICK
. u O , BAF,QU NO BID NO BID $9,110.00 $9,960.00 $9,440.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17,665.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9,395.00
i1 24 FROZEN, U.S GRADE A.
SPINACH, CHOPPED, U.S.
. ’ ! NO BID NO BID $23,160.00 $31,968.00 $37,152.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $83,112.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $42,000.00
i1_25 GRADE A OR FANCY.
FROZEN MIXED VEGETABLES
NO BID NO BID $34,920.00 $28,440.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $64,536.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $35,640.00
WITH PEAS, CARROTS, CORN,
il 26 GREEN BEANS, LIMA BEANS.
FROZEN CUT GREEN BEANS.
1 97 US GRADE "A" NO BID NO BID $27,720.00 $21,600.00 $22,656.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39,636.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $23,328.00
STIR FRY VEGETABLE BLEND
NO BID NO BID NO BID $20,016.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31,386.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20,304.00

i1 28

GRADE A
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