NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services

Office of Citywide Procurement

EPIN: 85726B0055
Bid Title: ACS - Dairy Products
Bid Opening Date: 5/22/2026

Procurement Analyst:

Alla Gaydukova

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY — SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION

Vendor Name

CLASS 1 (Milk & Yogurt) Totals

CLASS 2 (Spreadables) Totals

CLASS 3 (Cheese) Totals

CLASS 4 (Eggs) Totals

JAMAC FROZEN FOOD CORP. NO BID $ 34,138.52 80,209.62 NO BID
TERI NICHOLS INSTITUTIONAL FOOD MERCHANTS LLC NO BID S 54,904.46 103,641.20 36,320.00
MIVILA CORP. MIVILA FOODS NO BID S 36,146.80 87,401.80 129,360.00
DERLE FARMS INC $ 260,455.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ORITAS ROASTERS LLC $ 363,839.00 | $ 45,665.00 99,087.60 56,000.00
JABBER DORADO ENTERPRISES LLC $ 18,258,903.74 | $ 48,779.18 597,876.72 12,960.00




