
EPIN:
Bid Title:
Bid Opening Date:
Procurement Analyst:

CLASS 2 Totals CLASS 3 Totals CLASS 4 Totals CLASS 5 Totals
21,749.12$                                             105,106.58$                                          NO BID NO BID
59,821.20$                                             NO BID 122,720.00$                                          NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

23,281.60$                                             103,025.40$                                          142,800.00$                                          11,650.80$                                             
50,605.84$                                             585,173.72$                                          211,200.00$                                          16,877.60$                                             
66,872.00$                                             593,357.00$                                          104,000.00$                                          14,570.80$                                             ORITAS ROASTERS LLC 5,753,736.65$                                          

NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services
Office of Citywide Procurement

85725B0088
ACS - Dairy Products
5/23/2025

CREAM O LAND DAIRIES LLC 340,729.46$                                              
MIVILA CORP. MIVILA FOODS 396,086.86$                                              
Farm To People LLC 4,343,294.68$                                          

JAMAC FROZEN FOOD CORP. NO BID
TERI NICHOLS INSTITUTIONAL FOOD MERCHANTS LLC NO BID
DERLE FARMS, INC. 311,428.85$                                              

Vendor Name CLASS 1 Totals

Samirah Samad

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY – SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION


