NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services

Office of Citywide Procurement

EPIN: 85725B0083
Bid Title: ACS - Baby Foods
Bid Opening Date: 5/20/2025

Procurement Analyst:

Samirah Samad

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY — SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION

VENDOR NAME

Item Number Item Label Kekoa Foods, LLC MIVILA CORP. MIVILA FOODS FINESSE CREATIONS INC RC STILLWELL LLC

il PRO ADVANCE READY TO USE NO BID S 89.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 98.18
i2 NEOSURE 22CAL READY TO USE NO BID S 36.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 196.29
i3 PRO-SENSITIVE NON-GMO INFANT FORMULA WITH IRON NO BID S 53.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 188.48
i4 SPECIAL CARE 24 PREMATURE INFANT FORMULA WITH IRON AND OPTIGRO NO BID S 79.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 196.30
i5 GENTLEASE READY TO USE NO BID S 79.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 136.92
i6 PROSOBEE READY TO USE NO BID S 72.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 123.17
i7 NUTRAMIGEN READY TO USE NO BID S 108.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 142.70
i8 NEUROPRO INFANT NO BID S 64.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 131.83
i9 A.R. READY TO FEED INFANT FORMULA NO BID S 176.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 124.41
i10 NEUROPRO ENFACARE NO BID S 68.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 120.09
i11 PEDIASURE ASSORTED FLAVORS VANILLA/CHOCOLATE/STRAWBERRY NO BID S 61.90 | $ 60.00 | $ 56.17
i12 ENSURE ASSORTED FLAVORS VANILLA/CHOCOLATE/STRAWBERRY NO BID S 52.50 | $ 55.00 | $ 54.37
i13 PEDIALYTE NO BID S 53.75|$ 60.00 | $ 18.83
i14 SINGLE GRAIN OATMEAL BABY CEREAL NO BID S 43.85 | $ 50.00 | $ 44.04
i15 INSTANT OATMEAL NO BID S 2095 | $ 40.00 | $ 14.76
i16 MICROWAVEABLE PASTA BOWLS VARIETY PACK NO BID S 25.95|$ 25.00 [ S 17.80
i17 STAGE 1 FRUIT & VEGETABLE, ASSORTED VARIETY S 20.16 | $ 21.85 | $ 32.00 | $ 20.54
i18 STAGE 2 FRUIT & VEGETABLE, ASSORTED VARIETY $ 24.80 | $ 2395 S 23.00 [ $ 20.54
i19 STAGE 3 FRUIT & VEGETABLE, ASSORTED VARIETY $ 18.60 [ S 29.85 | $ 42.00 | $ 15.40
i20 STAGE 1 BABY FOOD-DINNER, ASSORTED VARIETY $ 1550 | $ 2385 (S 24.00 | $ 11.87
i21 STAGE 2 BABY FOOD DINNER, ASSORTED VARIETY $ 18.60 [ S 23.85|$ 25.00 [ S 11.87
i22 STAGE 3 BABY FOOD-DINNER, ASSORTED VARIETY $ 2268 | $ 36.90 | $ 24.00 | $ 11.87
i23 APPLESAUCE $ 12.60 [ S 23.85|$ 16.00 [ $ 4.26
i24 PUFFS NO BID S 2595 |$ 16.00 | $ 14.40
i25 TEETHING BISCUIT NO BID S 33.95|$ 17.00 [ $ 18.56
i26 LIL CRUNCHIES NO BID S 2595 |$ 25.00 | $ 27.76
i27 BABY TEETHERS NO BID S 35.85|$ 21.00 [ S 18.68
i28 LIL BISCUITS NO BID S 3235($ 30.00 | $ 27.76




