
EPIN:
Bid Title:
Bid Opening Date:
Procurement Analyst:

CLASS 2 Totals CLASS 3 Totals CLASS 4 Totals
230,550.00$                                           NO BID 269,500.00$                                           
603,270.00$                                           16,830.00$                                             NO BID
937,780.00$                                           NO BID 221,910.00$                                           
800,380.00$                                           NO BID 278,850.00$                                           

1,068,580.00$                                       39,955.00$                                             228,410.00$                                           
1,084,030.00$                                       89,955.00$                                             283,410.00$                                           
1,356,146.67$                                       113,850.00$                                           461,725.00$                                           Farm to People LLC 2,107,004.17$                                           

NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services
Office of Citywide Procurement

85725B0078
ACS - Meats & Poultry
5/23/2025

NEW PRODUCE TRADING INC 637,930.00$                                              
KINGSLAND PRIME MEATS LLC 485,194.00$                                              
Dardan Enterprise LLC 517,789.00$                                              

LIC COM LLC 664,090.00$                                              
JAMAC FROZEN FOOD CORP. 622,720.00$                                              
ROMEO FOODS INC 476,294.00$                                              

Vendor Name CLASS 1 Totals

Samirah Samad

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY – SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION


