
EPIN:
Bid Title:
Bid Opening Date:
Procurement Analyst:

Item Number Item Label
i1 28.95$                                                    36.00$                                                    57.05$                                                    
i2 27.85$                                                    36.00$                                                    51.12$                                                    
i3 79.85$                                                    72.00$                                                    89.63$                                                    
i4 99.95$                                                    150.00$                                                  154.83$                                                  
i5 19.85$                                                    30.00$                                                    36.33$                                                    
i6 20.85$                                                    25.00$                                                    24.84$                                                    
i7 18.95$                                                    30.00$                                                    33.27$                                                    
i8 18.95$                                                    30.00$                                                    29.18$                                                    
i9 18.95$                                                    30.00$                                                    40.26$                                                    
i10 25.85$                                                    25.00$                                                    36.77$                                                    
i11 25.85$                                                    25.00$                                                    37.41$                                                    
i12 34.95$                                                    35.00$                                                    20.34$                                                    
i13 25.85$                                                    25.00$                                                    38.92$                                                    
i14 25.85$                                                    25.00$                                                    38.92$                                                    
i15 189.00$                                                  195.00$                                                  220.05$                                                  
i16 149.00$                                                  110.00$                                                  48.90$                                                    

i17 54.90$                                                    60.00$                                                    68.17$                                                    

STAGE  2 FRUITS - BANANA

CARNATION BREAKFAST ESSENTIALS COMPLETE NUTRITIONAL DRINK HIGH 
PROTEIN, VANILLA

INFANT CEREAL  - OATMEAL  
INFANT CEREAL - RICE 
INFANT FORMULA - 360 TC 8 OZ
INFANT FORMULA - ADVANCE RTU
STAGE 1 FRUITS - APPLESAUCE
STAGE 1  FRUITS - PEAR
STAGE 1 VEGETABLE - SWEET POTATOES
STAGE 1 VEGETABLE - GREEN PEAS
STAGE 1 VEGETABLE - GREEN BEANS
STAGE 2 VEGETABLE - GREEN PEAS

STAGE 2 FRUITS - VARIETY FRUIT PACK
STAGE 2 COMBO - APPLE & CHICKEN
STAGE 2 COMBO - SWEET POTATO & TURKEY
HI-PRO PLUS FOOD SUPPLEMENT, VANILLA FLAVOR

23.64$                                                       
19.56$                                                       

NO BID
NO BIDPROPASS / WHEY PROTEIN POWDER SUPPLEMENT

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

15.84$                                                       
15.84$                                                       
19.56$                                                       

NO BID
NO BID

19.56$                                                       
19.56$                                                       

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY – SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION

Jivaunie Dennis

VENDOR NAME

Kekoa Foods, LLC MIVILA CORP. MIVILA FOODS FINESSE CREATIONS INC ESO CONSULTANTS LLC

5/20/2025
DOC Nutritional Supplements (Baby Food)
85725B0073

Office of Citywide Procurement
NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services


