
EPIN:
Bid Title:
Bid Opening Date:
Procurement Analyst:

CLASS 2 Totals CLASS 3 Totals CLASS 4 Totals
NO BID NO BID 80,370.00$                                             
NO BID NO BID 154,470.00$                                           

340,050.00$                                           8,990.00$                                               NO BID
396,150.00$                                           8,500.00$                                               NO BID
307,350.00$                                           7,990.00$                                               153,330.00$                                           
363,750.00$                                           NO BID 124,830.00$                                           
383,850.00$                                           6,990.00$                                               141,930.00$                                           Dardan Enterprise LLC 62,490.00$                                                 

NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services
Office of Citywide Procurement

85725B0072
DOC Meats & Poultry (Halal)
5/20/2025

LIC COM LLC 59,300.00$                                                 
KINGSLAND PRIME MEATS LLC 53,390.00$                                                 
NEW PRODUCE TRADING INC 60,150.00$                                                 

 JAMAC FROZEN FOOD CORP. 58,500.00$                                                 
 CARDINAL FOODS LLC NO BID

ROMEO FOODS INC 53,590.00$                                                 

Vendor Name CLASS 1 Totals

Jivaunie Dennis

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY – SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION


