NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services

Office of Citywide Procurement

EPIN: 85725B0069

Bid Title: DOC Meats & Poultry (GP)
Bid Opening Date: 5/20/2025

Procurement Analyst:  |Jivaunie Dennis

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY — SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION

Vendor Name CLASS 1 Totals CLASS 2 Totals CLASS 3 Totals
CARDINAL FOODS LLC NO BID NO BID S 845,000.00
JAMAC FROZEN FOOD CORP. S 289,140.00 NO BID S 690,000.00
ROMEO FOODS INC S 253,110.00 | $ 1,122,940.00 NO BID

KINGSLAND PRIME MEATS LLC S 255,020.00 | $ 1,183,140.00 | S 865,000.00
ADVANCED COMMODITIES, INC. MIDWEST QUALITY FOODS S 283,860.00 | $ 1,148,030.00 | S 980,000.00
NEW PRODUCE TRADING INC S 324,300.00 | $ 1,695,940.00 | S 840,000.00
Dardan Enterprise LLC S 321,930.00 | $ 1,806,340.00 | $ 1,245,000.00




