
EPIN:
Bid Title: FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY – SUBJECT TO VERIFICATION
Bid Opening Date:
Procurement Analyst

Item Code Item Description CARTER 1 BEAM GLOBAL INF Associates LLC Paired Power, Inc.
i1_1 STANDALONE SOLAR CHARGING UNIT FOR CAR ONLY $2,214.00 $80,955.00 $80,955.00 $89,883.14
i1_2 STANDALONE SOLAR CHARGING UNIT FOR CAR AND BIKE $2,471.50 $81,455.00 $81,455.00 $96,586.00
i1_3 STANDALONE SOLAR CHARGING UNIT FOR BIKE ONLY $2,380.00 $81,955.00 $80,955.00 $99,996.00
i1_4 GRID-TIED SOLAR CANOPY WITH CHARGING STATIONS (3) STATIONS $2,281.00 no bid $118,900.00 $293,238.70
i1_5 GRID-TIED SOLAR CANOPY WITH CHARGING STATIONS (6) STATIONS $2,244.00 no bid $227,800.00 $420,561.00
i1_6 GRID-TIED SOLAR CANOPY WITH CHARGING STATIONS (9) STATIONS $2,380.00 no bid $336,700.00 $577,016.00
i1_7 GRID-TIED SOLAR CANOPY WITH CHARGING STATIONS $2,471.50 no bid $445,000.00 $734,308.00

Vendors

NYC Department of Citywide Administrative Services
Office of City Prourement

85725B0030
Carports Solar Powered Vehicle Chargers

3/4/2025
Masha Rudina


