
Procurement Summary  
Basic Information 

Procurement Title: Immigrant Services Program funded via Community Service 
Block Grant 

 
 
 
 

Agency: Human Resources Administration 
 
 
 
 

 

Agency Email Contact: accoprocurements@hra.nyc.gov 
 
 
 

 

Procurement Description: 

The Immigrant Services program provides legal services to non-
citizens to assist with applications for citizenship, permanent 
residence, and many other immigration-related legal services. 
The Human Resources Administration (HRA) is seeking 
qualified providers to implement the Immigrant Services 
programs in conjunction with the Mayor’s Office of Immigrant 
Affairs (MOIA) and the Department of Youth & Community 
Development (DYCD) through multiple RFPs for four different 
service options. Immigrant Services are funded through the 
federal Community Services Block Grant (CSBG). Goals for 
CSBG immigrant services include assisting immigrants to 
become more self-sufficient, strengthening immigrant families 
and support systems, and improving the living conditions of 
immigrant households for the four identified services options. 
Separate Requests for Proposals (RFPs) will be issued for each 
of the four service options. 
 
Formerly administered by DYCD, the Immigrant Services 
program has historically supported a range of services for 
immigrants: legal assistance to help immigrant adults and youth 
attain citizenship and lawful immigration status; legal and social 
services for immigrant survivors of domestic violence and 
human trafficking; and services designed to provide information, 
education, advocacy and legal services to protect low-wage 
immigrants from exploitation and violations of their employment 
rights.  Immigrant Services will consist of four different service 
options: 
 
• Legal Services for Immigrants 
• Legal Services for Immigrant Youth 
• Services for Survivors of Domestic Violence and Trafficking 
• Services for Immigrant Workers 
 
Selected vendors will have the capacity to serve non-English 
speaking clients consistent with the demographics of the 
community that the proposer will service within the four different 
service options (RFP’s) not limited to geographic locations 

  

Concept Report Link: 

http://www.nyc.gov/html/hra/downloads/pdf/ 
contracts/concept_papers/2014/dec_2014/ 
immigrant_services_program.pdf 
  

 
 
 
 

 

 
HHS Accelerator Service Applications: 

 

 
To receive this RFP in the HHS Accelerator system, you must 
have an approved Service Application for at least one of the 
following: 
 

• Legal Services  
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